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 From the Sky 
 
Relating topographical maps to the geography around you is an interesting exercise. The topographical 
base could be a physical map or a digital map. Add a layer of trekking & this exercise becomes more 
participatory with variable point of views. Add another layer of aviation and it ups the stakes. This blog 
tries to loosely document this journey of mine for the past two decades. 
 
My trekking journey began in the monsoon of 1992, parallel to my architectural training. The Sahyadri 
mountain range around Mumbai was our playground. This was pre Google era when limited physical 
maps were our only source of studying the geography around us. Survey of India’s meticulously prepared 
maps was available but it was only for a trained eye. For an average trekker there were very few books, 
mostly in Marathi which made a limited attempt to make such topographical information understandable 
and available. In 1979 Harish Kapadia published 'Trek the Sahyadri' in English. Many contributed towards 
its content and information. This was one of the few available books in English then which tried to 
document these topographical data into maps readable by all. Moreover it identified the goals (hill tops 
with elevations in this case) and made it relatable to the surrounding hill tops/ geographical features/ 
goals in a visually understandable way. I bought the fourth edition of this book as my first guidebook, also 
my first theoretical introduction to the field of mountaineering. It had minimalistic monochromatic hand 
drawn maps of the various hills of Maharashtra s Western Ghats as per various regions which I could 
easily relate to while trekking. 
 
In 1995 came 'Sahyadri Companion' by Young Zingaro Trekkers. It was compiled by a group of 
enthusiastic trekkers who went to great lengths to 'upgrade' the then available mountaineering literature 
for Maharashtra, especially their maps with colour coded topography. Stepper slopes were dark coloured, 
milder slopes were lighter shades of same colour, plateaus/ plains were uniformly coloured. Water 
bodies, roads, foot tracks, human settlements enroute was also represented in complementary colour 
coding. In the Survey of India maps same features were represented in monochrome. Contour lines were 
in splines. Denser splines indicated stepper slopes and spaced out splines indicated gradual slopes or 
plains. Studying the colourful maps was obviously more fun and was easier to understand the geography. 
'Sahyadri Companion' was immediately popular in the trekking circles. And there were those various self 'I 
don’t believe it' moments when I came back exhausted from one of such many gruelling treks and 
browsed through the maps to study the distance and altitudes we had just covered. 
 
During my treks these maps were always at the back of mind so I could experience geography unfolded 
in front of my eyes. Identifying/ observing the hill profiles from various angles and altitudes while on the 
trek had to be routinely complimented with this study. An important point to remember here is that 
identifying the hill tops or peak profiles is an easier task in the Sahyadri than the Himalayas due to their 
distinctive features. In the Himalayas most of the peaks are variations of the pyramids hence a bit tricky to 
identify. Identifying peaks, geographical features also helps us navigate correctly especially when you get 
lost. Here I draw a parallel with the aviation industry. In aviation before the advent of GPS (Global 
Positioning System) pilots flew by what is known as VFR (Visual Flight Rules). The pilot must know the 
geographical features around the air fields and enroute to know where he is flying. VFR is obsolete today 
for commercial services but still applicable for training and many helicopter flights. 
 
As an aviation enthusiast my first saving was promptly spent on buying Microsoft Flight Simulator 1998 
which cost a modest Rs.3000 then. I was going to ‘e’ fly. During many of my treks in the hills around 
Mumbai (especially the Matheran range of hills) I had always observed aircrafts flying low over the hills 
around Mumbai. Their low altitude sounds in the valleys was distinctly different from the continuous drone 
of an aircraft flying at high altitudes. Now that I 'flew' I knew  that most of these low flying aircrafts heading 
west were lining up for the final approach into Mumbai, eventually to land on runway 27. 
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Further links; 
 
For more of my articles do visit; 
https://drive.google.com/drive/folders/12IMzgBFyBTsZFbsrASErq3Pf6Om9vW0H 
https://drive.google.com/drive/folders/1ok66TQj3z0CYIkrOjDJuPYUJsyn6Uy1H 
 
Contact 
rajneeshgore@gmail.com 


